
PRAISE REPORTS NOVEMBER 2023 
 
November 30th 
Hope –  praise God that my friend Alexia gave birth to a healthy beauHful baby girl called Nala 
Pearl. She is our answered prayer. We had prayed for this precious baby ,the mother’s health ( 
WOW) baby’s health, the whole pregnancy…. Our God is so faithful ! We give Glory to God 
 
November 26th 
5 people decided to follow Jesus on Sunday at Bethel. 
 
November 26th 
24 people were bapHzed in water today at Bethel. 
 
November 24 
Sarah – Praise God! I have been out of a job for 5 years. I’ve been praying to God for a Federal 
Government job and i got it. He is able to do exceedingly and abundantly above all we can hope 
or imagine. I’m excited because  this week I started work and I love that I’m doing what I studied 
and I feel a sense of purpose. 
 
November 19th 
5 people decided to follow Jesus on Sunday at Bethel. 
 
November 16th 
1 person rededicated  their life to Jesus online this week. 
 
November 12th 
6 people decided to follow Jesus on Sunday at Bethel. 
 
November 9th 
One person decided to follow Jesus mid week and filled out our salvaHon form on our website. 
 
November 8th 
Maryanne – I want to share with you the incredible ways in which Jesus has been at work in my 
life. In the midst of the challenges outlined in my previous prayer request, I am thrilled to tesHfy 
to His faithfulness. Following the unexpected terminaHon of my previous job and the financial 
strain that ensued, I turned to prayer for solace and guidance. In His perfect Hming, Jesus 
opened a door for me, and I am now employed with a nonprofit organizaHon that aligns with 
my passions and values. Though it’s a short-term contract and I need a year to secure 
Permanent Residency, I am grateful for this opportunity and place my trust in God’s mercy and 
grace to conHnue guiding my journey. This experience has been a powerful reminder of God’s 
provision and His ability to turn challenging situaHons into opportuniHes for growth and 
blessing. I am overwhelmed with graHtude for the support and prayers of the Bethel 
community, and I am excited to conHnue walking this journey of faith with each of you. Thank 



you for standing with me in prayer, and may we conHnue to witness the transformaHve power 
of Jesus in our lives. With hearaelt joy. 
 
November 5th 
Two people decided to follow Jesus at Bethel on Sunday! 
 
November 1st 
Ginebe – I’ve been praying, asking for prayers from my Bethel family for my daughter Stephanie 
to be released from the devil. God is a strong God and he is stronger than the Devil. With 
prayers Stephanie has found Jesus. She is coming to church, she’s abended mega prayer night 
last week and has been coming to church on Sundays. Needless to say, the devil sHll comes ader 
her but now she has God to fight him. I conHnue to pray for her everyday. 


